
Award Worksheet

Purchasing Entity: Shelby County Government Run Date: 12/16/15   1:21 pm

500Bid ID: Awarded:

Description: NEW AND UNUSED 2016 FOUR DOOR MID 12/16/2015  12:00 PM Bids Due By:

Bids Sealed Until: 12/16/2015  12:00 PM NEW AND UNUSED 2016 FOUR DOOR MIDCategory:

Effective Start Date:

Effective End Date:

Vendor Summary Information

Response Payment TermsResponse TermsVendor Name Response Dollar Summary

Autonation - Ford Net 30  553,244.0000

CHUCK HUTTON CHEVROLET  203,362.0160

Landers Ford All specs met unless otherwise noted.  All 

warranties 5 year 60000 miles except on 

pursuit rated vehicles, which goes up to 5 

year 100000 mile powertrain warranty.  EIN 

62-1786911

net 30  575,218.0200

shelbyville chrysler products inc 30 days 30days and eeoc applied for old eeoc is 

0918-26325

 409,273.9250
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Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

No lotted items found for the selected criteria.

1 0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 1

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

MID SIIZE FOUR DOOR 

FLEET SEDAN

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: chevrolet - n/a

Product Number: n/aQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

19,165.0000 1 19,165.00Item #: 1

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

MID SIIZE FOUR DOOR 

FLEET SEDAN

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Fusion SEQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford Fusion SE.  5 year 60000 mile warrant.  EIN 62-1786911

19,171.0000 1 19,171.00Item #: 1

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

MID SIIZE FOUR DOOR 

FLEET SEDAN

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - ufch41

Product Number: chrysler 200 limitedQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: 30 days. note eeoc applied for old eeoc is 0918-26

Response Item Notes: biding a Chrysler 200 limited 2016

19,218.2400 1 19,218.24Item #: 1

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

MID SIIZE FOUR DOOR 

FLEET SEDAN

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: FusionQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 60 month/60000 miles power train warranty, console shift lever

2 0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 2

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

MID SIZE HYBRID FOOUR 

DOOR FLEET SEDAN

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET
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Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - N/A

Product Number: N/AQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

23,575.0000 1 23,575.00Item #: 2

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

MID SIZE HYBRID FOOUR 

DOOR FLEET SEDAN

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Fusion HybridQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford Fusion SE Hybrid.  5 YR 60000 mile warranty.  EIN 62-1786911

23,628.2400 1 23,628.24Item #: 2

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

MID SIZE HYBRID FOOUR 

DOOR FLEET SEDAN

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Fusion HybridQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: Engine: 2.0L ivct Atkinson I-4 Hybrid, 60 month/60000 miles power train warranty, console shift lever 

3 0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 3

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE FOUR DOOR 

FLEET SEDAN

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - N/A

Product Number: N/AQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

20,851.2400 1 20,851.24Item #: 3

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE FOUR DOOR 

FLEET SEDAN

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: TaurusQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 60 month/60000 miles power train warranty, console shift lever
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Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

21,317.0000 1 21,317.00Item #: 3

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE FOUR DOOR 

FLEET SEDAN

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Taurus SEQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford Taurus SE.  All specs met. 5 yr 60000 mile warranty.  EIN 62-1786911

22,087.3600 1 22,087.36Item #: 3

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE FOUR DOOR 

FLEET SEDAN

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - ldde48 police with a

Product Number: ldde48Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: 30 days

Response Item Notes: eeoc has beed applied for old number is 0918-26325

4 0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 4

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE HYBRID FOUR 

DOOR FLEE SEDAN

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - N/A

Product Number: N/AQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

0.0100 1 0.01Item #: 4

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE HYBRID FOUR 

DOOR FLEE SEDAN

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: TaurusQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Notes: No Bid.  

5 0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 5

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FOUR DOOR POLICE 

PURSUIT SEDAN

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - N/A

Product Number: N/AQuoted as Spec'd: Yes
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Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

23,113.0000 1 23,113.00Item #: 5

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FOUR DOOR POLICE 

PURSUIT SEDAN

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - ldde48 police

Product Number: ldde48Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: 30 days

Response Item Notes: applied for eeoc old number is 0918-26326

24,149.0000 1 24,149.00Item #: 5

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FOUR DOOR POLICE 

PURSUIT SEDAN

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Taurus InterceptorQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford Taurus Interceptor. All specs met.  5 year 100000 warranty on police unit.  EIN 62-1786911

24,176.2400 1 24,176.24Item #: 5

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FOUR DOOR POLICE 

PURSUIT SEDAN

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Police pursuit sedanQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: No ground stud in trunk, 6 speed transmission, Engine: 3.5L V6, passenger seat 2 way manual reclining

6 0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 6

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FOUR DOOR POLICE 

PURSUIT SEDAN W/ DUAL 

SPOTS

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - N/A

Product Number: N/AQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

23,312.0000 1 23,312.00Item #: 6

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FOUR DOOR POLICE 

PURSUIT SEDAN W/ DUAL 

SPOTS

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc
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Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - ldde48 police

Product Number: ldde48Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: 30 days

Response Item Notes: eeoc number applied for old number is 0918-26325

24,330.2400 1 24,330.24Item #: 6

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FOUR DOOR POLICE 

PURSUIT SEDAN W/ DUAL 

SPOTS

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Police pursuit sedanQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: Assist handle one front passenger, No ground stud in trunk, 6 speed transmission, 3.5L V6 engine

24,512.0000 1 24,512.00Item #: 6

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FOUR DOOR POLICE 

PURSUIT SEDAN W/ DUAL 

SPOTS

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Taurus InterceptorQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford Taurus Interceptor with dual spotlight.  5 year 100000 mile warranty on pursuit vehicles.  all specs met.  

EIN 62-1786911

7 19,543.0000 1 19,543.00Item #: 7

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

1/2 TON REGULAR CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - ds1l62

Product Number: ram 1500 8 footQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: 30 days

Response Item Notes: eeoc number applied for old number is 0918-26325

21,190.9800 1 21,190.98Item #: 7

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

1/2 TON REGULAR CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count Autonation - Ford
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Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: F150 Reg. CabQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 60 month/60000 miles power train warranty, rear trailer sway control, No dual AC

21,722.0000 1 21,722.00Item #: 7

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

1/2 TON REGULAR CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - SILVERADO

Product Number: 1500Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

24,525.0000 1 24,525.00Item #: 7

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

1/2 TON REGULAR CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: F-150 Regular CabQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford F-150 Regular Cab.  All specs met. 5 year 60000 mile warranty.  EIN 62-1786911

8 21,535.3600 1 21,535.36Item #: 8

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

1/2 TON EXTENDED CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - ds1l41

Product Number: ram 1500 quad cabQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: 30 days

Response Item Notes: eeoc number applied for

23,717.9800 1 23,717.98Item #: 8

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

1/2 TON EXTENDED CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: F150 extended cabQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: Vinyl floor covering, 60 month/60000 miles power train warranty, rear trailer sway control, no dual AC
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Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

24,627.0000 1 24,627.00Item #: 8

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

1/2 TON EXTENDED CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - SILVERADO

Product Number: 1500Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

26,305.0000 1 26,305.00Item #: 8

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

1/2 TON EXTENDED CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: F-150 SCQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford F-150 SC XLT.  Specs met.  5 year 60000 warranty.  EIN 62-1786911

9 0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 9

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

1/2 TON CREW CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - SILVERADO

Product Number: 1500Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 9

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

1/2 TON CREW CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: no bid - no bid

Product Number: no bidQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

26,412.9800 1 26,412.98Item #: 9

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

1/2 TON CREW CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: F150 Crew CabQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 60 month/60000 miles power train warranty, rear trailer sway control, no dual AC

8



Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

28,046.0000 1 28,046.00Item #: 9

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

1/2 TON CREW CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: F-150Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford F-150 Crew.  Specs met.  5 year 60000 mile warranty. EIN 62-1786911

10 0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 10

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

1/2 TON EXTENDED CAB 2 

DOOR TRUCK W/ UTILITY 

BODY

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - N/A

Product Number: N/AQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 10

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

1/2 TON EXTENDED CAB 2 

DOOR TRUCK W/ UTILITY 

BODY

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: no bid - no bid

Product Number: no bidQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: no bid

30,115.0000 1 30,115.00Item #: 10

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

1/2 TON EXTENDED CAB 2 

DOOR TRUCK W/ UTILITY 

BODY

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: F-250Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 F250 with service body.  all specs met.  5 year 60000 mile warranty.  EIN 62-1786911

31,693.7200 1 31,693.72Item #: 10

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

1/2 TON EXTENDED CAB 2 

DOOR TRUCK W/ UTILITY 

BODY

1 - Count Autonation - Ford
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Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: F250 extended cabQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 3/4 ton, W/Service Body & Utility Rack, if rolls over to 2017 can not protect price

11 24,948.3600 1 24,948.36Item #: 11

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

3/4 TON CREW CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - dj2l91

Product Number: ram 2500 crewQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: 30 days

Response Item Notes: eeoc number applied for old number is 0918-26325

26,308.7200 1 26,308.72Item #: 11

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

3/4 TON CREW CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: F250 Crew CabQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: Vinyl floor covering, 60 month/60000 miles power train warranty, no dual AC, if rolls over to 2017 can not protect 

price

28,941.0000 1 28,941.00Item #: 11

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

3/4 TON CREW CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: F250Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford F250.  all specs met.  5 year 60000 mile warranty.  EIN 62-1786911

30,115.0000 1 30,115.00Item #: 11

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

3/4 TON CREW CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - SILVERADO
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Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

Product Number: 2500HDQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

12 29,233.7200 1 29,233.72Item #: 12

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

3/4 TON 4X4 CREW CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: F250 Crew 4X4Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 60 month/60000 miles power train warranty, Vinyl floor covering, No dual zone AC, if rolls over to 2017 can not 

protect price

29,357.3600 1 29,357.36Item #: 12

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

3/4 TON 4X4 CREW CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - dj7l91

Product Number: ram 2500 crew 4by4Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: 30 days

Response Item Notes: eoc number applied for old number is 0918-26325

31,372.0000 1 31,372.00Item #: 12

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

3/4 TON 4X4 CREW CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: F250 CC 4x4Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford F250 Crew 4X4 XLT.  specs met.  5 year 60000 mile warranty.  EIN 62-1786911

32,380.0000 1 32,380.00Item #: 12

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

3/4 TON 4X4 CREW CAB 

TRUCK

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - SILVERADO

Product Number: 2500HDQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

11



Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

13 0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 13

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

3/4 TON EXTENDED CAB 2 

DOOR TURCK W/ UTILITY 

BODY

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - SILVERADO

Product Number: N/AQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 13

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

3/4 TON EXTENDED CAB 2 

DOOR TURCK W/ UTILITY 

BODY

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - no bid

Product Number: no bidQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

35,523.0000 1 35,523.00Item #: 13

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

3/4 TON EXTENDED CAB 2 

DOOR TURCK W/ UTILITY 

BODY

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: F350Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford F350 with canopy body.  per specs.  5 year 60000 mile warranty.  EIN 62-1786911

35,580.4000 1 35,580.40Item #: 13

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

3/4 TON EXTENDED CAB 2 

DOOR TURCK W/ UTILITY 

BODY

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: F350 Ext CabQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes:  W/Service Body & ladder rack, if rolls over to 2017 can not pr0tect price  

14 0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 14

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 1 

TON DUAL WHEELED 

CREW CAB TRUCK 

W/FLAT BED

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET
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Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - SILVERADO

Product Number: N/AQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

43,473.0000 1 43,473.00Item #: 14

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 1 

TON DUAL WHEELED 

CREW CAB TRUCK 

W/FLAT BED

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: F450Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford F450 with flat bed.  per specs.  5 year 60000 mile warranty.  EIN 62-1786911

43,632.9000 1 43,632.90Item #: 14

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 1 

TON DUAL WHEELED 

CREW CAB TRUCK 

W/FLAT BED

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: F450Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: Trailer sway control, goose-neck ball hitch with 25,000lb trailer weight, If rolls over to 2017 can not protect price

45,130.8600 1 45,130.86Item #: 14

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 1 

TON DUAL WHEELED 

CREW CAB TRUCK 

W/FLAT BED

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - dp4l94

Product Number: ram 4500Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: 30 days

Response Item Notes: eoc number applied for old number is 0918-26325

15 0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 15

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

COMPACT, LONG WHEEL 

BASE CARGO VAN

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - N/A

Product Number: 000Quoted as Spec'd: Yes
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Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

21,446.0000 1 21,446.00Item #: 15

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

COMPACT, LONG WHEEL 

BASE CARGO VAN

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Transit ConnectQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford Transit Connect Cargo.  5 year 60000 mile warranty.  EIN 62-1786911

21,481.2400 1 21,481.24Item #: 15

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

COMPACT, LONG WHEEL 

BASE CARGO VAN

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Transt ConnectQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: No Glass on side panels

22,567.3600 1 22,567.36Item #: 15

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

COMPACT, LONG WHEEL 

BASE CARGO VAN

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - vmdl51

Product Number: ram promaster cargoQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: 30 days

Response Item Notes: eoc number applied for old number 0918-26325

16 0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 16

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

COMPACT, 120" WHEEL 

BASE PASSENGER VAN

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - N/A

Product Number: 000Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

21,467.3600 1 21,467.36Item #: 16

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

COMPACT, 120" WHEEL 

BASE PASSENGER VAN

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - rtkh53
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Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

Product Number: dodge grand caravanQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: 30 days

Response Item Notes: eoc number applied for old number is 0918-26325

22,409.0000 1 22,409.00Item #: 16

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

COMPACT, 120" WHEEL 

BASE PASSENGER VAN

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Transit WagonQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford Transit Connect Passenger Wagon.  5 year 60000 mile warranty.  EIN 62-1786911

22,494.2400 1 22,494.24Item #: 16

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

COMPACT, 120" WHEEL 

BASE PASSENGER VAN

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Transit connectQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

17 23,500.0000 1 23,500.00Item #: 17

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

3/4 TON CARGO VAN

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - EXPRESS

Product Number: 2500Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

25,040.9800 1 25,040.98Item #: 17

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

3/4 TON CARGO VAN

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: TransitQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: 130" WB, 25 gal. fuel tank

26,769.0000 1 26,769.00Item #: 17

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

3/4 TON CARGO VAN

1 - Count Landers Ford
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Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 
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Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: TransitQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford Transit Cargo.  5 year 60000 mile warranty.  EIN 62-1786911

28,635.3600 1 28,635.36Item #: 17

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

3/4 TON CARGO VAN

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - vf1l12

Product Number: ram promaster van 15Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: 30 days

Response Item Notes: eoc applied for old number is 0918-26235

18 0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 18

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 1 

TON MID-HEIGHT 15 

PASSENGER VAN

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - N/A

Product Number: 000Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 18

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 1 

TON MID-HEIGHT 15 

PASSENGER VAN

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - no bid

Product Number: no bidQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

29,671.0000 1 29,671.00Item #: 18

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 1 

TON MID-HEIGHT 15 

PASSENGER VAN

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Transit PassengerQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford Transit MR Passenger.  5 year 60000 mile warranty.  EIN 62-1786911
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Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

30,203.9800 1 30,203.98Item #: 18

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 1 

TON MID-HEIGHT 15 

PASSENGER VAN

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: TransitQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

19 0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 19

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

MID SIZE SPORT UTILITY 

VEHICLE

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - N/A

Product Number: 000Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

20,061.2400 1 20,061.24Item #: 19

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

MID SIZE SPORT UTILITY 

VEHICLE

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: EscapeQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: No rear passenger AC control, No dual zone AC, Mini spare tire, 60 month/60000 miles power train warranty, 

2.5L Duratec I-4 Engine

20,518.3600 1 20,518.36Item #: 19

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

MID SIZE SPORT UTILITY 

VEHICLE

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - jcde49

Product Number: dodge journey sxtQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: 30 days

Response Item Notes: eoc applied for old numer is 0918-23325 note production starts again in may

25,825.0000 1 25,825.00Item #: 19

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

MID SIZE SPORT UTILITY 

VEHICLE

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: ExplorerQuoted as Spec'd: Yes
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Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

Response Item Payment Terms: net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford Explorer.  5 year 60000 mile warranty.  EIN 62-1786911

20 0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 20

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

MID SIZE HYBRID SPORT 

UTLITIY VEHICLE

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - N/A

Product Number: 000Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 20

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

MID SIZE HYBRID SPORT 

UTLITIY VEHICLE

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - no bid

Product Number: no bidQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

0.0100 1 0.01Item #: 20

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

MID SIZE HYBRID SPORT 

UTLITIY VEHICLE

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Hybrid SUVQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Notes: No bid

21 0.0010 1 0.00Item #: 21

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE SPORT UTILITY 

VEHICLE

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - N/A

Product Number: 000Quoted as Spec'd: Yes

27,423.2400 1 27,423.24Item #: 21

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE SPORT UTILITY 

VEHICLE

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: ExplorerQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: No dual zone AC, Mini spare tire, 3.39 ratio rear axle, 3.5L V6 engine
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Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

29,389.3600 1 29,389.36Item #: 21

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE SPORT UTILITY 

VEHICLE

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - wdde75

Product Number: dodge durango ssv rwQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: 30 days

Response Item Notes: eoc applied for old eoc is 0918-26325note carpet and cloth seats only front and rear

32,198.0000 1 32,198.00Item #: 21

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE SPORT UTILITY 

VEHICLE

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: ExpeditionQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford Expedition.  5 year 60000 mile warranty.  EIN 62-1786911

22 27,892.0000 1 27,892.00Item #: 22

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE POLICE 

PURSUIT UTILITY VEHICLE

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Explorer InterceptorQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford AWD Utility Interceptor.  5 year 100000 mile on pursuit vehicle warranty.  EIN 62-1786911

28,222.2400 1 28,222.24Item #: 22

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE POLICE 

PURSUIT UTILITY VEHICLE

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Utility PIQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: No rear AC controls in rear, no dual zone AC, No child seat restrain, single battery, 3.7L V6 engine,  ADD: rear 

wiring kit & front wiring kit 
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Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

29,047.3600 1 29,047.36Item #: 22

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE POLICE 

PURSUIT UTILITY VEHICLE

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - wdde75

Product Number: dodge durango ssv rwQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: 30 days

Response Item Notes: eoc applied for note old eoc is 0918-26325. note carpet and cloth seats only and one spot lite

35,200.0000 1 35,200.00Item #: 22

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE POLICE 

PURSUIT UTILITY VEHICLE

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - TAHOE

Product Number: PPVQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

23 27,990.0000 1 27,990.00Item #: 23

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE POLICE 

PURCUIT UTILITY 

VEHICLE W/ DUAL SPOTS

1 - Count Landers Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Explorer InterceptorQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: net 30

Response Item Notes: 2016 Ford Explorer AWD Utility interceptor with dual spots.  5 year 100000 mile on pursuit vehicles warranty.  EIN 

62-1786911

28,341.2400 1 28,341.24Item #: 23

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE POLICE 

PURCUIT UTILITY 

VEHICLE W/ DUAL SPOTS

1 - Count Autonation - Ford

Manufacturer & Part Number: Ford

Product Number: Utility PIQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: Net 30

Response Item Notes: no rear AC controls in rear, no dual zone AC, no child seat restrain, single battery, 3.7L V6 engine,  ADD: rear 

wiring kit & front wiring kit

20



Line 

Number

Lot 

Code Purchase Unit Vendor 

Response 

Quantity

Pending 

AwardTotal PriceItem Description Bid Price

Pending 

Award 

Quantity

Pending 

Award 

Total 

29,450.4600 1 29,450.46Item #: 23

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE POLICE 

PURCUIT UTILITY 

VEHICLE W/ DUAL SPOTS

1 - Count shelbyville chrysler 

products inc

Manufacturer & Part Number: chrysler group llc - wdde75

Product Number: dodge durango ssv rwQuoted as Spec'd: Yes

Response Item Payment Terms: 30 days

Response Item Notes: eoc applied for old number is 0918-26325. note carpet and cloth seats only

35,818.0000 1 35,818.00Item #: 23

NEW AND UNUSED 2016 

FULL SIZE POLICE 

PURCUIT UTILITY 

VEHICLE W/ DUAL SPOTS

1 - Count CHUCK HUTTON 

CHEVROLET

Manufacturer & Part Number: CHEVROLET - TAHOE

Product Number: PPVQuoted as Spec'd: Yes
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